
Bid #16-045

FY2016 Scanners, Printers, Computers, Laptops and Tablets for the County of El Paso

Opening Date: Tuesday, August 23, 2016

Description Est. Qty.
Brand 

/Model #
Unit Cost Extended Cost 3% Local Pref

Brand 

/Model #
Unit Cost Extended Cost 3% Local Pref Brand /Model # Unit Cost Extended Cost 3% Local Pref

Brand

 /Model #
Unit Cost Extended Cost

Brand 

/Model #
Unit Cost Extended Cost 3% Local Pref

1) Dell or HP PC All in One with Single Monitor 180
Dell Opti 

Plex 7440
$1,052.00 $189,360.00 $195,040.80 Dell F6NVC $1,223.00 $220,140.00 $226,744.20 Dell 7440 AIO $1,223.10 $220,158.00

Total Total $207,151.12 Total $239,907.60 Total Total

2) Dell or HP PC with Dual Monitors Micro computer 175
Dell Opti 

Plex 7040
$918.00 $160,650.00 $165,469.50 Dell MXMOH $971.00 $169,925.00 $175,022.75

Dell 7040 

Micro
$924.13 $161,722.75

Total Total $177,243.43 Total $187,640.25 Total Total

3) Dell or HP Laptop - Standard 77 Dell WYCKT $1,053.00 $81,081.00 $83,513.43 Dell E5470 $1,151.32 $88,651.64

Total Total Total $93,030.63 Total Total

4) Hardened Ruggedized Notebook 21
Panasonic CF-

3118369CM
$4,640.00 $97,440.00 $100,363.20

Dell Rugged 

5404
$1,553.50 $32,623.50

Total Total Total $104,993.53 Total Total

5) Microsoft Surface Pro 4-12” 3
Microsoft 9PY-

00001
$1,118.00 $3,354.00 $3,454.62

Dell Microsoft 

Surface Pro 4
$1,389.19 $4,167.57

Total Total Total $1,338.00 $4,014.00 $4,134.42 Total Total

6) Laser Printer Black and White 

(Printer LaserJet M604dn)
105

HP LaserJet 

M604dn
$618.70 $64,963.50 $66,912.41 HP E6B68A#BGJ $680.91 $71,495.55 $73,640.42

Dell Smart 

Printer 

S5830DN

$792.99 $83,263.95

Kodak 

Alaris 

i2620

$728.79 $76,522.95 $78,818.63

Total Total $91,530.59 Total $89,945.11 Total Total $78,818.63

7) Scanner 105
Canon 

DR-M160II
$734.00 $77,070.00 $79,382.10

Fujitsu

F-1 7160
$835.50 $87,727.50 $90,359.33 Canon 0114T279 $770.00 $80,850.00 $83,275.50

Epson 

Workforce DS-

760

$699.00 $73,395.00

Total $87,633.95 Total $106,506.12 Total $96,794.25 Total Total

8) F5M Tablet 4 Rugged (5404) $1,626.88 $6,507.52

Total Total Total Total Total

Approved by (signature) Approved by (Print)

Recommendation Date BC 08/23/2016

CDW Government LLC

Vernon Hills, Illinois

Included Included

Included

Included

Included

Included

Included

$76,522.95

$

1b) Full Warranty for 5 years from date of purchase          

2b) Full Warranty for 5 years from date of purchase          

3b) Full Warranty for 3 years from date of purchase

4b) Full Warranty 3 years from date of purchase

No Bid

No Bid

$

$ $172,081.00

$

No Bid

$11,431.00

$201,117.60

No Bid

$

$11,757.60

5 Years $65.32

No Bid

No Bid

5b) Full Warranty for 3 years from date of purchase

6b) Full Warranty for 3 years from date of purchase

7b) Full Warranty for 3 years from date of purchase

8b) Full Warranty for 3 years from date of purchase

$85,081.50

No Bid

$83,263.95

1st Run Computer Services Inc.

Garden City, New York

$12,110.32

Included

$6,507.52

$4,167.57

$88,651.64

$32,623.50 $

$

Included

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$8,251.85

$

$

$

$

3 years 

$

No Bid No Bid

$103,404.00

$

$149.30 $15,676.50

$227.63 $23,901.15

$

3 Years

$88,864.65

$8,011.50$76.30 1 Years

No Bid

No Bid

$24,618.18

$16,146.80

$15,829.80

$87,325.35

5 Years $71.00 $12,780.00

$232,920.00

3 Years $70.00 $12,250.00

$182,175.00

3 Years $120.00 $9,240.00

$90,321.00

No Bid

No Bid

1 Year $150.76

3 Years $214.07 $4,495.47

ABC Lazer USA

Norcross, Georgia

COMPU-DATA  International, LLC

The Woodlands, Texas

$220,158.00

$161,722.75

5 Years

No Bid

$11,773.93

Checkpoint Services, Inc.

El Paso, Texas

$

No Bid

$

$101,935.47

3 Years $220.00 $660.00

$65.32 $13,163.40

$12,617.50

$9,517.20

$4,630.33

$679.80

$16,304.69

$13,518.75

$73,395.00

$13,125.00

$93,975.00

3 Years $125.00
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Brand 

/Model #
Unit Cost Extended Cost

Brand 

/Model #
Unit Cost Extended Cost 3% Local Pref

Brand

/Model #
Unit Cost Extended Cost 3% Local Pref

Brand 

/Model #
Unit Cost Extended Cost 3% Local Pref

Brand 

/Model #
Unit Cost Extended Cost 3% Local Pref Brand /Model # Unit Cost Extended Cost 3% Local Pref

Dell GDHFDB $1,315.00 $236,700.00 $243,801.00
Dell OptiPlex 

7440 
$999.00 $179,820.00 $185,214.60

Dell OptiPlex 

3240 
$938.48 $168,926.40 $173,994.19

Total Total Total $243,801.00 Total $197,514.04 Total $956.84 $172,231.20 $177,398.13 Total

Dell 7R7H1B $1,100.00 $192,500.00 $198,275.00

Dell OptiPlex 

3040 Model # 

7R7H1

$696.00 $121,800.00 $125,454.00

Lenovo 

ThinkCentre 

M900z 

$1,090.94 $190,914.50 $196,641.94

Total Total Total $198,275.00 Total $140,234.50 Total $1,185.50 $207,462.50 $213,686.38 Total

Dell 0KR4WB $1,300.00 $100,100.00 $103,103.00
Dell Latitude 3470 

#76JPF
$871.50 $67,105.50 $69,118.67

Levovo 

ThinkPad L450 

20S001MUS
$1,318.84

$101,550.68 $104,597.20

Total Total Total $103,103.00 Total $76,811.74 Total $1,380.96 $106,333.92 $109,523.94 Total

CF-

3110451BM
$3,700.00 $77,700.00 $80,031.00

Latitude 14 

Rugged 5414  

#210-AJRP

$1,755.42 $36,863.82 $37,969.73
Dell Latitude 

E54704G RAM
$797.62

$16,750.02 $17,252.52
CF-3110451KM

CF-SVCBATTXT2Y 
$3,295.09 $69,196.89 $71,272.80

Total Total Total $80,031.00 Total $37,969.73 Total $990.94 $20,809.74 $21,434.03 Total $74,544.77

9PY-00001 $1,220.00 $3,660.00 $3,769.80
Microdot Surface 

Pro 4 Model #9PY-
$972.16 $2,916.48 $3,003.97

12.3"-Core 

i5-6300U 
$2,038.21 $6,114.63 $6,298.07

Total Total Total $3,769.80 Total $1,053.16 $3,159.48 $3,254.26 Total $2,135.87 $6,407.61 $6,599.84 Total

E6B68A $705.00 $74,025.00 $76,245.75
HP 

E6B68A#BGJ
$1,130.00 $118,650.00 $122,209.50

HP LaserJet 

M604dm Model 

#E6868A#BGJ

$778.00 $81,690.00 $84,140.70
Dell B3460DN 

TPNJ7
$321.29 $33,735.45 $34,747.51

Total Total $76,245.75 Total $122,209.50 Total $96,922.95 Total $416.02 $43,682.10 $44,992.56 Total

Kodak i2620 $895.75 $94,053.75 PDS-6000 $1,399.99 $146,998.95 $151,408.92

Xerox 

XDM36405M-

WU

$1,395.00 $146,475.00 $150,869.25
Fujitsu fi-7160 

#PA03670-8055
$856.64 $89,947.20 $92,645.62

Canon DR-

6010C 

PN3801B002

$1,340.77 $140,780.85 $145,004.28

Total Total $151,408.92 Total $150,869.25 Total $110,062.10 Total $1,823.77 $191,495.85 $197,240.73 Total

FC71FCDA1

DXX
$2,250.00 $9,000.00 $9,270.00

Xplore 

Technocolor-F5M 

i5 

#lt428562732343

$2,806.41 $11,225.64 $11,562.41
HP ElitePad 

1000 G2
$1,899.00 $7,596.00 $7,823.88 LT424562822343 $3,287.13 $13,148.52 $13,542.98

3 years $208.44 $833.76 $858.77 3 Years $88.92 $355.68 $366.35

Total Total Total $9,270.00 Total $12,421.18 Total $1,987.92 $7,951.68 $8,190.23 Total $13,542.98

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

3 years

$250.29

3 years

$81.00 $243.00

Free phone support for life

Included

Included 

$ $74,025.00

$

$193.32Included

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$118.19 $12,409.95

3 years

$3,660.00

$100,100.00

$77,700.00

Included

$97.00 $7,469.00

Included

Included

No Bid

$

Included 3 years

$118,650.00

Included

Included

$4,181.51

$301.77

$10,245.05

$52,236.45

$3,271.97

3 Years $94.73 $9,946.65

3 Years $97.66 $292.98

$4,059.72 2 years $151.27

$

$3,176.67

$12,059.40 $13,148.52

$106,856.40 $

$94,099.95 $

$161.04 $16,909.20 1 year $483.00 $50,715.00

$36,863.82 $72,373.56

$ $9,000.00

 2 Years $66.40 $11,941.20  5 Year $18.36 $3,304.80

$191,761.20 $

$74,574.50

 2 Years 

$146,998.95 $146,475.00

$

$

No Bid

$ $192,500.00

$ $236,700.00

Lin-Cum, Inc.

Phoenix, Arizona

DataXport.Net, LLC

El Paso, Texas 

$

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$

$

$

$94,053.75

$

Enhanced Laser Products

Houston, Texas

Howard Technology Solutions

A division of Howard Industries, Inc.

Laurel, Mississippi

Hypertec USA, Inc. (dba Hypertec Direct)

Tempe, Arizona

$12,299.44

$14,780.50

$7,693.07

$136,150.00

Included

No Bid

No Bid

$

 2 years 

$82.00 $14,350.00 5 years

Included

$

No Bid

$16,548.00

$3,403.94

$17,044.44

$4,926.743 years $62.12 $4,783.24

PCS Mobile

Denver, Colorado

$94.56

Included

$12,782.25

$17,416.48
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Unit Cost 3% Extended Cost

Brand /Model 

#
Unit Cost Extended Cost 3% Local Pref Brand /Model # Unit Cost 3%Extended Cost

Brand /Model 

#
Unit Cost Extended Cost 3%Local Pref Brand /Model # Unit Cost Extended Cost 3% Local Pref Brand /Model # Unit Cost Extended Cost 3% Local Pref

HP/Eliteone 

800
$892.10 $160,578.00 $165,395.34

OptiPlex 7440 

AIO
$1,223.10 $220,158.00

HP EliteOne 

800 G2 
$1,003.00 $180,540.00 $185,956.20

HP EliteOne 

800
$820.22 $147,639.60 $152,068.78

HP/L3N90AV 

800
$914.54 $164,617.20 $169,555.72

Total Total $923.40 $166,212.00 $171,198.36 Total Total $185,956.20 Total $152,068.79 Total $175,095.47

HP/ProDesk 

400
$709.30 $124,127.50 $127,851.33

OptiPlex 7040 

MFF w/ 

P2317H  

$924.13 $161,722.75
HP ProDesk 

400 G2 
$804.50 $140,787.50 $145,011.13

HP ProDesk 

400 Min
$831.57 $145,524.75 $149,890.49

HP/ 400 G2 

DMM2V15AV
$729.20 $127,610.00 $131,438.30

Total Total $740.60 $129,605.00 $133,493.16 Total Total $145,011.13 Total $149,890.49 Total $136,824.17

HP/ProBook 

640
$862.30 $66,397.10 $68,389.01

Del Latitude 

E5470
$1,163.31 $89,574.87 HP $976.00 $75,152.00 $77,406.56

HP ProBook 

640
$1,071.82 $82,530.14 $85,006.04

HP/640 G2 

L8U33AV
$797.87 $61,435.99 $63,279.07

Total Total $895.30 $68,938.10 $71,006.24 Total Total $77,406.56 Total $85,006.04 Total $69,455.73

HP/GETAC 

S400
$1,670.10 $35,072.00 $36,124.16

Dell Latitude 

14 Rugged
$2,846.09 $59,767.89

GETAC 

B300G5
$3,039.96 $63,839.16 $65,754.33

GETAC/B300G

S-A950852
$1,669.88 $35,067.48 $36,119.50

Total Total $1,670.10 $35,072.10 $36,124.16 Total Total Total $65,754.33 Total $36,119.50

HP/Elite x2 $1,144.30 $3,432.90 $3,535.89
Microsoft 

Surface Pro-4
$1,231.19 $3,693.57

HP Elite X2 

1012 G1
$1,311.96 $3,935.88 $4,053.95

HP 

M5/N4E62AV
$1,144.66 $3,433.98 $3,537.00

Total Total $1,229.80 $3,689.40 $3,800.09 Total $1,231.19 $3,693.57 Total Total $4,053.95 Total $3,795.51

HP/LaserJet 

M604dn
$591.10 $62,065.50 $63,927.47

HP LaserJet 

M604dn
$790.00 $82,950.00

HP LaserJet 

Enterprise 

M604DN

$568.00 $59,640.00 $61,429.20
HP LaserJet 

M604
$774.60 $81,332.77 $83,772.99

HP M604DN-

E6B68A
$615.25 $64,601.25 $66,539.29

Total Total $695.30 $73,006.50 $75,196.70 Total Total $74,482.91 Total $83,772.99 Total $79,497.82

Canon DR-

M160 II
$775.00 $81,375.00

HP/Scanjet 

7000
$679.30 $71,326.50 $73,466.30

Epson 

WorkForce DS-

760 document 

$699.00 $73,395.00 Fujitsu 7160 $853.65 $89,633.25 $92,322.25
HP Scanjet 

7000
$871.33 $91,489.65 $94,234.34 Fujitsu-Fl7160 $824.66 $86,589.30 $89,186.98

Total Total $783.50 $82,267.50 $84,735.53 Total Total $92,322.25 Total $94,234.34 Total $106,021.61

Latitude 12 

Rugged Tablet
$1,626.88 $6,507.52

GETAC RX 10 

Tablet
$2,001.20 $8,004.80 $8,244.94

3 Years Included Included

Total Total Total Total Total $8,244.94 Total

No Bid

$12,958.53

$16,834.63

Included

Included

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Included

No Bid

NO Bid

No Bid

Included Included

5 Years Included Included

Included

$161,722.75

$5,229.00

$77.88 $5,996.76

$67,432.75

5 Years Included Included

$35,067.48

3 Years $83.66

$

$

$250.98

$59,767.89

Included

Included

Included

3 Years  Included

$89,574.87

$6,176.66

Included

$258.51

$ $63,839.16

Technical & Scientific Application, Inc.

Houston, Texas

Synergy Electronics, Inc.

Kingsland, Texas

5 Years $29.88

$140,787.50 $145,524.75

Included Included

$75,152.00 $82,530.14

United Imaging, Inc.

Woodland Hills, California

$5,539.75

$5,385.87

$132,839.00

3 Year

Included

Included

$180,540.00 $147,639.60

$13,053.713 Years Included Included $120.70 $12,673.50

$73,395.00 $89,633.25

NO Bid

$91,489.65

$82,950.00 $72,313.50 $81,333.00

1 year Included Included 1 Year

Included

3 Years $104.20

$81,375.00

$10,941.00 $11,269.23

$31.30 $5,477.50

$11,269.23$10,941.00

3 Years $85.50 $256.50

3 Years $0.00 $0.00

$

5 Years

$3,684.96

3 Year $119.82 $12,581.10

$77,182.35

3 Years $155.66 $16,344.30

$102,933.60

$6,507.52 $ $8,004.80

$ $3,935.88

5 Years $29.88 $5,378.40

$169,995.60

3 Years $104.20

3 Years   $33.00 $2,541.00 1 Year Included Included

$

$

$2,617.23

$0.00

$264.20

Spectrum Technologies

El Paso, Texas

5 Years $31.30 $5,634.00 5 Years  Included Included

$220,158.00

$5,803.02

SHI Government Solutions                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                

Austin, Texas

Professional Document Systems, Inc.

El Paso, Texas

$

$

$5,641.83

Included

Included


